2023 Clothing Bid Q-0823-02 - Vendor Award List

Awarded Items in
Orange

No items awarded

No items awarded

Item

Size Ranges

Part #

Color

Specifications/
Customization

Ball Caps Fitted

SM/Med, Lg/XL

Richardson Pro 400s6

navy

Department
Stitch count: 4557
Size: (Width
120.8mm) (Height
38.4 mm)
Location: Center
Front Thread
color: Madeira
1811 Silver PMS-
428 or Robinson
anton Goldenrod

Estimated
Quantity

Five Star

Jonah Ent. (Brooklyn, NY)

MPAK (Aledo, TX)

80

$16.50

$15.59

17.38

Ball Caps Adjustable

SM/Med, Lg/XL

Richardson Pro 415

navy

Logo: Coppell Fire
Department
Stitch count: 4557
Size: (Width
120.8mm) (Height
38.4 mm)
Location: Center
Front Thread
color: Madeira
1811 Silver PMS-
428 or Robinson
anton Goldenrod

60

$15.88

$20.69

16.40

Knit Cap Short

One size

Port & Company CP91

navy

Department
Stitch count: 4557
Size: (Width
120.8mm) (Height
38.4 mm)
Location: Center
Front 1" Above
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson anton
Goldenrod

24

$7.50

$12.74

8.59

Knit Cap Rolled

One size

Port & Company CP92

navy

Logo: Coppell Fire
Department
Stitch count: 4557
Size: (Width
120.8mm) (Height
38.4 mm)
Location: Center
Front 1" Above
Fold Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson anton
Goldenrod

36

$8.00

$13.68

8.46




Boonie Hat

One size

TRU-SPEC Poly / Cotton
Ripstop Gen Il Adjustable
Boonie #3312

navy

Logo: Coppell Fire
Department
Stitch count: 4557
Size: (Width
120.8mm) (Height
38.4 mm)
Location: Center
Front Thread
color: Madeira
1811 Silver PMS-
428 or Robinson
anton Goldenrod

36

$20.00

$21.80

$ 17.38

Nomex Shirts Class B Short Sleeve

36-58

WR730NX45NB -WORKRITE
Nomex IlIA Firefighter shirt

navy

and rank strips
embroidered onto
Nomex navy fabric
consistent with the
shirt fabric and
sewn onto the shirt
above the pockets.
For Captain rank

120

NO BID

$144.70

S 187.56

Nomex Shirts Class B Long Sleeve

36-58

WR735NX45NB WORKRITE
Nomex IlIA Firefighter shirt

navy

Same as specs
above for short
sleeve shirt

60

NO BID

$152.35

S 227.60

White Shirt S/S (Admin Chiefs)

#71183 5.11 Twill PDU shirt

white

Sew 4" patch - Left
Sleeve: CFD patch
(supplied by us)
Right Sleeve: An
EMS patch
(supplied by us)

NO BID

$69.10

48.16/54.60 3xI-6x

White Shirt L/S (Admin Chiefs)

#72344 5.11 Twill PDU shirt

white

Sew 4" patch - Left
Sleeve: CFD patch
(supplied by us)
Right Sleeve: An
EMS patch
(supplied by us)

NO BID

$74.50

51.80/59.07 3XL/6XL

Nomex Pants- Station MENS

ALL

#402NX75NB WORKRITE 7.5
NOMEX FULL CUT PANTS

navy

Inseam up to 35"

120

$140.00

$133.22

S 198.99

Nomex Pants- Station MENS

#402NX75NB WORKRITE 7.5
NOMEX FULL CUT PANTS

navy

Inseam over 35"

36

$175.00

$133.22

S 198.99

Nomex Pants- Station WOMENS

WORKRITE 7.5 OZ. NOMEX
IIIA WOMEN'S INDUSTRIAL
PANT Item#: TU481 MDNV

NAVY

$145.00

$99.90

192.49/257.24 (22-24)

Station Wear Belt

28"-54"

#59409 5.11 1.5” Tactical
Trainer Belt, 5 stitch

black

No customization

48

$35.99

$48.60

34.10/39.13 (2XL-4XL)

Workout Shorts

S-XXL

Badger 7219 Mesh shorts

Drk navy

Embroidery left
thigh: COPPELL
FIRE DEPARTMENT
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson anton
Goldenrod

80

$17.00

$21.43

$ 16.91




Workout Pants

S-XXXL

Sprt Tex ST238

navy

thigh below
bottom of pocket :
COPPELL FIRE
DEPARTMENT
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson anton
Goldenrod

48

$29.99

39.5865

31.99-37.19

Station Wear Shorts

28"-54"

#73308 5.11 Taclite Pro 11"
shorts

navy

No customization

64

$45.00

$46.80

$

38.07

T-shirts (Short Sleeve)

SXL;

#8000 Gildan T-shirt, short
sleeved

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

220

$16.00

$24.14

19.16

T-shirts (Short Sleeve)

2XL

#8000 Gildan T-shirt, short
sleeved

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

90

$17.00

$25.08

21.50

T-shirts (Short Sleeve)

3XL

#8000 Gildan T-shirt, short
sleeved

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

12

$19.00

$27.07

23.33




T-shirts (Long Sleeve)

S-XL;

#8400 Gildan T-shirt, LONG
sleeved

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

160

$19.00

$26.20

22.63

T-shirts (Long Sleeve)

2XL- 3XL

#8400 Gildan T-shirt, LONG
sleeved

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

50

$22.00

$30.46

24.06 (2XL)/26.49 (3XL)

Polo shirt (Short Sleeve)

S-XL

Workrite 263TK67

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

72

$95.10

$78.71

127.84

Polo shirt (Short Sleeve)

XXL+

Workrite 263TK67

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811

SILVER PMS-428

36

$95.10

$88.81

127.84




Polo shirt (Long Sleeve)

S-XL

Workrite 262TK67

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

72

$102.00

$80.78

139.41

Polo shirt (Long Sleeve)

XXL+

Workrite 262TK67

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

24

$102.00

$96.38

139.41

Job Shirt OPS

S-XL

5.11 Jobshirt, Navy, #72315

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

94

$77.00

$81.40

66.43

Job Shirt OPS

XXL-XXXL; XL TALL +

5.11 Jobshirt, Navy, #72315

navy

Includes Screen-
print Back/3" CFD
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811

SILVER PMS-428

48

$84.00

$91.30

74.54




Job Shirt LSP S-M 5.11 Jobshirt, Navy, #72315  |navy
Includes Screen-
print Back/3" LSP
patch FLC (supplied
by us)/Name, Rank,
EMS cert FRC
specify gold or 2
silver stitching;
SPECIFY ROBINSON
ANTON
GOLDENROD OR
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428 $77.00 $81.40 66.43
Class A Hat all sizes Midway 114 Bell Crown Cap- [navy Navy Cap- 100%
Dark Navy all one material polyester
Bell Cap gabardine Navy
band with
removable black
rayon braid Silver 48
FD buttons 611
pattern visor 1/2"
black plastic strap
7" x7-5/8"
NO BID $89.09 60.84
Class A Hat all sizes Midway 114 White Bell Cap  [white White cap -al
(Chiefs) white with vinyl
top with white
band and black
visor and gold 4
expansion strap,
gold FD buttons
NO BID $89.09 60.84
Class A Coat all sizes 38800 Fechheimer, Men's navy Sew 4" patch - Left
Dress Coat
Sleeve: CFD patch
(supplied by us) 48
Specify silver or
gold FD buttons NO BID $228.39 184.33
Class A Coat- Honor Guard all sizes 38800 Fechheimer, Men's navy Sew 4" patch - Left
Dress Coat Sleeve: HG patch
(supplied by us)
Specify silver or 8
gold FD buttons
White citation cord
left shoulder make
epaulet operable NO BID $228.39 199.70
Class A Pants all sizes FECH- TRO70 Fechheimer-, navy o 45
Men's Pants No customization NO BID $87.52 64.38
Dress Belt all sizes DM1151-30 1.5 inch black black/silver
leather garrison dress belt 40
sliver buckle No customization NO BID $25.19 19.44
Tie 57" #90081 Samuel Broome black
Necktie w/button holes 3.5” x 36
577 No customization NO BID $8.09 4.65
Tie 61" #90099 Samuel Broome black
Necktie w/button holes 3.5" 24
x 61" No customization NO BID $8.09 4.65
Tie Clip on 16 in UA494 BLK 16IN 3IN black
POLYESTER CLIP ON TIE W/ 6
BUTTONHOLE No customization NO BID $9.00] 3.80




Tie Clip on

REG 18"

UA494 BLK REG 3IN
POLYESTER CLIP ON TIE W/
BUTTONHOLE

black

No customization

12

NO BID

$9.00

$ 3.80

Tie Clip on

Long 20"

UA494 BLK LNG 3IN
POLYESTER CLIP ON TIE W/
BUTTONHOLE

black

No customization

NO BID

$9.00]

S 3.80

Class A White Dress Shirt

S-6XL reg and tall/long

EDW- 1363- 00 Edwards-
White L/S Dress Shirt

white

No customization

40

NO BID

$37.79

S 21.13

Dress Shoe Bates

all sizes

BATES-22141 Bates High Gloss|
Duty Uniform Shoe

black

No customization

40

NO BID

$81.00

S 55.90

Dress Shoe Rocky

all sizes

Mfg# FQ00510-8 Rocky Mens
Pro Cell Hi Gloss Oxford

black

No customization

12

NO BID

$108.90

$ 63.70

Name Plate/bar

N/A

J3 Blackington name bar

SILVER

DOUDIE CIUtch
back, black block
lettering,
(Silver:FF/Eng/Capt
ain/ Inspector;

60

NO BID

$22.61

S 13.50

Name Plate/bar

N/A

J3 Blackington name bar

GOLD

DOUDTE TTUTCIT
back, black block
lettering, Gold:
BC/Division Chief/
Deputy Chief/Fire
Chief)

NO BID

$22.61

$ 13.50

Coat Soft Shell (Admin staff)

S-3XL

#48167 5.11 Tactical Valiant
soft shell Jacket

navy

3™ CFD Patch
FLC(supplied by us)
/Name & Rank FRC
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson Anton
Galdenrad

$130.00

$162.70

122.91/139.95 (3xI-4xI)

Jacket( BC's and Admin Staff)

S-3XL

#48026, 5.11 Big horn Jacket

navy

FLC(supplied by us)
/Name & Rank FRC
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson Anton
Goldenrod

$80.00

$100.60

$ 78.75

Coat(Ops)

ALL

GOW-70RX1 GOW Gerber
EclipseSX

navy

Sew 3" CFD
patch(supplied by
us) left chest on
both layers,
Screenprint
reflective COPPELL
FIRE DEPARTMENT
back of outer layer
only, Velcro and
removable name
strip on both layers

36

NO BID

$317.50

253.91 (S-L); 258.20 (XL-2XL);
353.10 (3XL)

GEAR BAG(OPS)

Port&Company, Colorblock
sport Duffel Bag, Navy /
charcoal #BG99

NAVY/GRAY

embroidery:
COPPELL FIRE
DEPARTMENT First
initial. last name
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson anton
Goldenrod

50

$32.00

$46.89

$ 35.79




FA/LSP Fleece Jacket LADIES

Port Authority L229 Full Zip Fld

navy

S—TSFPateT
FLC(supplied by us)
/Name, Title, FLSE
& CPST certs FRC
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428

$32.00

$34.39

35.85

5.11 Taclite TDU S/S shirt

Style # 71339

navy

Embroidery name
right side above
pocket embroidery
title left side above
pocket sew CFD
patch left sleeve 1"
below shoulder
seam(supplied by
us) sew ems patch
right sleeve 1"
below shoulder
seam(supplied by
us) bugleson
collar points if
applicable

12

NO BID

$101.10

79.16

5.11 Taclite TDU L/S shirt

Style # 72054

navy

Embroidery name
right side above
pocket embroidery
title left side above
pocket sew CFD
patch left sleeve 1"
below shoulder
seam(supplied by
us) sew ems patch
right sleeve 1"
below shoulder
seam (supplied by
us) bugles on
collar points if
applicable

12

NO BID

$106.50

82.80 (S-2XL); 90.07
(3XL/AXL/TALL)

HG Polo shirt

port authority

gray

12

$23.00

$29.80

35.94 (S-XL); 37.24 (2XL)

EM/Fire Dress shirt ladies L/S

L608

navy

FLC Logo/FRC Pers

FLC(supplied by us)
/Name & Rank FRC
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson Anton
Goldenrod

24

$31.00

$36.01

30.04

LSP Dress shirt ladies

L608

navy

S—TSPPaterT
FLC(supplied by us)
/Name, Rank, FLSE
& CPST certs FRC
Thread color:
Madeira 1811

Silver PMS-428

$31.00

$36.01

30.04




EM/Fire Dress shirt Men's S/S

$508

navy

FLC(supplied by us)
/Name & Rank FRC
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson Anton
Goldenrod

12

$30.00

$31.96

28.74

EM/Fire Dress shirt Men's L/S

S608

navy

FLC(supplied by us)
/Name & Rank FRC
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson Anton
Goldenrod

12

$31.00

$36.01

30.04

LSP/EM Nike Polo Mens

363807 Men's Nike Polo

navy

FLC/FRC Pers/Full B

$43.25

$33.89

32.75

FA/LSP/EM Nike Polo ladies

S-L

NKDC1991 Ladies Nike Polo

navy

FLC/FRC Pers/Full B

$43.25

$36.59

39.29

LSP Polo

S-XL

Port Authority Silk Touch
Performance Polo L540

navy

S TSP PatCITTTC
(supplied by us)
/Name, Title, FLSE
& CPST certs FRC
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428

30

$23.00

$25.75

22.37

EM Polo

Port Authority Silk Touch
Performance Polo L540

navy

FLC(supplied by us)
/Name & Rank FRC
Thread color:
Madeira 1811
Silver PMS-428 or
Robinson Anton
Goldenrod

$23.00

$25.75

22.37

Elbeco Pants-Men's

28-56

# E7364R 37 ELBECO REFLEX
CARGO POCKET TROUSER

navy

No customization

12

NO BID

$92.69

65.13

5.11 Stryke pants MENS

ALL

#74369

navy

No customization

$84.00

$85.50

60.37

5.11 Stryke pants LADIES

ALL

#64386

navy

No customization

$75.00

$73.80

69.88

5.11 Tac Lite Pro LADIES

ALL

TR642

NAVY

No customization

NO BID

$52.20

42.48

5.11 Fast-Tac urban LADIES

ALL

TR1275

NAVY

No customization

NO BID

$43.20

36.62

EM/LSP jacket ladies

S&M

EB533 Ladies Crosshatch Jacke]

navy

FLC/FRC Pers/Back

$63.75

$83.86

v |nnunln

71.88

EM/LSP jacket mens

EB532 Men's Crosshatch Jacke

navy

FLC/FRC Pers/Back

$63.75

$83.86

71.88 to 77.08

LSP Duffel bag

108087 Big Dome Duffel

navy

Side Logo & Pers

N[N | N |00 |00

$50.00

$59.01

$

51.98

LSP DECORATED GILDAN T-SHIRT

Gildan 8000

navy

TICTUUES STreeTT=
print Back/3" LSP
patch FLC/Name,
Title, cert FRC
silver stitching;
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

10

$17.00

$17.14

19.16

LSP DECORATED GILDAN LONG SLEEVE T-
SHIRT

Gildan 8400

navy

TITCTUUES STreeTT=
print Back/3" LSP
patch FLC/Name,
Title, cert FRC
silver stitching;
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428

10

$20.00

$20.70

22.63

LSP- Nike Tshirt

NKBQ5231

navy

FLC/FRC/Full BacK

36

$45.00

$41.59

30.53




TITCTUUES SCIeeTT™

LSP Winter Coat M Port Authority Ladies All- navy K .
Season Il Jacket L304 print Back/3" LSP
patch FLC/Name,
Title, cert FRC 2
silver stitching;
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428 $72.00 $74.99 69.59
LSP Rain Coat M CORE365 Ladies' Climate navy TS SETEETT
3 R print Back/3" LSP
Seam-Sealed Lightweight
. . patch FLC/Name,
Variegated Ripstop Jacket Titl ERC
78185 e, cert vt 2
silver stitching;
MADIERA 1811
SILVER PMS-428 $72.00 $71.76 83.25
Breast cancer t-shirts S-XL #8000 Gildan T-shirt, short Navy
sleeved Includes Screen-
print Back/ screen 140
print FLC Pink $15.00 $11.64 12.00
Breast cancer t-shirts 2XL 3XL #8000 Gildan T-shirt, short Navy
sleeved Includes Screen- 80
print Back/ screen
print FLC Pink $17.00 $16.07 15.00




