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LED ROADWAY LIGHTING 

LTD. JDR INDUSTRIES SOLARMAX LED DYNAMIC VISION CO. FACILITIES SOLUTIONS GROUP TECHLINE, INC.

JB ELECTRIC LIGHTING & 

DESIGN
A. Structure:

1. Illumination Pole Assembly 50 EACH No Bid 50 EACH No Bid 50 EACH No Bid 50 EACH No Bid 50 2650 each $132,500 50 EACH $135,750 50 EACH $2,309
B. Approved LED  Fixture:

1. Trastar fixture

JXM-ST140 (130W) 254169

100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH $24,800.00 100 305 each $30,500.00 100 EACH  100 EACH  
2. LED Roadway Lighting

fixture 

NXT72M-600mA-HB 100 EACH ###### 100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH  100 EACH  100 EACH  
3. American Electric Lighting 

fixture

ATB2 60BLEDE70 MVOLT R2 

BK 100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH No Bid 100 EACH  100 EACH  100 EACH  

C. Other LED Fixture

1. LED Roadway lighting fixture

NXTL60M-700mA-2ES 100 EACH ###### 100 EACH

ARD2-150-UNIV-R2S-4K-NON-P3-BK-N - $205.04

SGL2-150-UNIV-R2S-4K-NON-P3-BK-SLP-NON - $187.65 100 EACH SMX-110WIE-NV-LV2-00-4070-T202-P-BK - $148.00 100 EACH

DURA-ST25 The latest TXDot model - 

$23,200.00 208 EACH

Lumec-12rm.108W48 $20,800

LED4K-G2-R3M-UNV DMG-RCD7-PH9-BK 100 EACH

Lumec # RFM - 108W48LED4K-G2-R3M-

UNV - $21,500

DMG-RCD7-PH9-BK 100 EACH

DMSL-G47-080 - $256.00

RMS-S-L2-100W-LPS ROMANSO 

- $229.00

Bid Summary:  Bid Summary:  Bid Summary:  Bid Summary:  Bid Summary:  Bid Summary:  Bid Summary:  

Subtotal A: No Bid NA No Bid $0.00 $132,500.00 $135,750.00  

Subtotal B: $343.31 NA No Bid $24,800.00 $30,500.00   

Subtotal C: $238.88 $20,504.00/ alt $18,765.00 $14,800 $23,200.00 $20,800.00 $21,500.00 $25,600/$22,900 Romanso

#Q-0120-01 Streetlight Poles and LED Fixtures


